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Clinicians undergoing competency testing, certification, and periodic recertification are frequently faced with
computer-based exams designed to evaluate clinical acumen and judgment. Test questions often include an
image or radiograph followed by a vignette of the clinical encounter and a series of questions. Designed to
better prepare practitioners for image-intense, computer-based examinations in their respective fields, Atlas
of Human Poisoning and Envenoming is a visual and written reminder of the ubiquitous sources of toxins
and toxoids in the environment and the outcomes of accidental or intentional toxic exposures in humans.

The Second Edition has been restructured with bulleted text, tables, and figures resembling the vignettes
that accompany national examinations. Combining the four specialties of toxicology—analytical, medical,
environmental, and industrial—into one comprehensive atlas, the book presents photographs and diagrams of
toxic plants and animals, their mechanisms of poisoning or envenoming, and the human responses caused by
toxic exposure. Highlights of the new edition include:

Prescription and illicit drug abuse epidemics●

Environmental and occupational nephrotoxicology and neurotoxicology●

Tick paralysis●

Petrochemical toxicants●

Biological, chemical, and radiological warfare agents●

Workplace substance abuse screening and monitoring●

Epidemiological design and statistical analysis of toxicological investigations●

The book is conveniently divided into four sections covering general medical toxicology, environmental
toxicology, industrial and occupational toxicology, and epidemiology and statistics for toxicology.
Supplemented with a 16-page color insert, the second edition includes new images and tables. The atlas will
be a useful study guide for a range of practitioners preparing for a lifetime of image-intense national
examinations.
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From reader reviews:

German Montoya:

The knowledge that you get from Atlas of Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second Edition may be the
more deep you searching the information that hide inside the words the more you get interested in reading it.
It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Atlas of Human Poisoning and Envenoming,
Second Edition giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of way
that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known
enough. This book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can
go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having that Atlas of
Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second Edition instantly.

Eric Butler:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Atlas of Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second
Edition as your daily resource information.

Tony Hill:

Atlas of Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second Edition can be one of your starter books that are good
idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that may increase
your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing Atlas of
Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second Edition nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the
reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one among it. This great
information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Ralph Pettie:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news.
With this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the Atlas of Human Poisoning and Envenoming, Second Edition when you desired it?
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