
Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the
Kingston Penitentiary

Peter H. Hennessy

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00AKAE78Q
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00AKAE78Q
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B00AKAE78Q


Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston
Penitentiary

Peter H. Hennessy

Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary Peter H. Hennessy

A report in 1833 by a committee of three respected Kingston colonials called for the construction of a
limestone penitentiary on Hatter’s Bay to the west of the town. Their report contained these words of advice
for its future governors: "…[shall] be a place by every means not cruel and not affecting the health of the
offender, [but] shall be rendered so irksome and so terrible that during his lifetime he may dread nothing so
much as a repetition of the punishment…" The obvious contradiction within this historical mandate of
Canada’s Big House has bedevilled the entire history of the jail. Its original high moral purpose - penitence
through silent reflection - drifted away into the foggy realm of official myth almost as soon as the first
convicts arrived in 1835.

This semi-documentary study of the Kingston Penitentiary by a local writer and historian lays bare in cool
prose the rapid descent from puritanical purpose to merely punitive management. For the first 75 years,
repression was accepted as the norm, even applauded, by the local citizens, some of the inmates, and the
political establishment. Over the last hundred years, repressive practices at Kingston Peneitentiary have been
publicized, analyzed, and increasingly denounced. In the outcome, the Big House at Kingston has become
almost unmanageable. What to do with it? The question still hangs in the air.
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From reader reviews:

Arlene Martin:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Canada's Big House: The Dark
History of the Kingston Penitentiary. All type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the
internet resources or other social media.

Mary Lee:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important for us. The book Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary was
making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The publication Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary is
not only giving you considerably more new information but also to be your friend when you truly feel bored.
You can spend your own personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship together with
the book Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary. You never really feel lose out
for everything in the event you read some books.

Nancy Rush:

This book untitled Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary to be one of several
books which best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of
benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retailer or you can order it through
online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your
list.

Lewis Wade:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This publication Canada's Big House: The Dark History of the Kingston Penitentiary
was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence.
Some people has diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you
can experience enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book you wanted.
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