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Alice C. Fletcher (1838–1923), one of the few women who became anthropologists in the United States
during the nineteenth century, was a pioneer in the practice of participant-observation ethnography. She
focused her studies over many years among the Native tribes in Nebraska and South Dakota.

Life among the Indians, Fletcher’s popularized autobiographical memoir written in 1886–87 about her first
fieldwork among the Sioux and the Omahas during 1881–82, remained unpublished in Fletcher’s archives at
the Smithsonian Institution for more than one hundred years. In it Fletcher depicts the humor and hardships
of her field experiences as a middle-aged woman undertaking anthropological fieldwork alone, while
showing genuine respect and compassion for Native ways and beliefs that was far ahead of her time. What
emerges is a complex and fascinating picture of a woman questioning the cultural and gender expectations of
nineteenth-century America while insightfully portraying rapidly changing reservation life.

Fletcher’s account of her early fieldwork is available here for the first time, accompanied by an essay by the
editors that sheds light on Fletcher’s place in the development of anthropology and the role of women in the
discipline.
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From reader reviews:

Sonya Wright:

The book Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the
Anthropology of North American Indians) can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork
among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the Anthropology of North American Indians)? Some of you have
a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each
other; you may share all of these. Book Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork among the Sioux and
Omahas (Studies in the Anthropology of North American Indians) has simple shape but the truth is know: it
has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by wide open and read a guide. So it is
very wonderful.

Jessie Taylor:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork
among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the Anthropology of North American Indians), you can enjoy both.
It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind
hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Lynda Alford:

This Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the Anthropology of
North American Indians) is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who
also always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it facts
accurately using great manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read the
idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences
but challenging core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Life among the Indians: First
Fieldwork among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the Anthropology of North American Indians) in your
hand like obtaining the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no e-
book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this is good
reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt in which?

Maria Green:

The book untitled Life among the Indians: First Fieldwork among the Sioux and Omahas (Studies in the
Anthropology of North American Indians) contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains her idea



with easy technique. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do certainly not worry, you
can easy to read it. The book was written by famous author. The author gives you in the new era of literary
works. You can actually read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or product, so you can
read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open
their official web-site and order it. Have a nice go through.
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