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Authored by a world-renowned expert in liposculpture, this volume is the definitive guide to facial and body
contouring. Dr. Toledo describes in detail the innovative techniques he developed or perfected to achieve
optimal cosmesis with smaller incisions, local anesthesia, minimal scarring, no stigma, and a short recovery
period. Each technique is demonstrated by a typical case. More than 1,000 full-color photographs and
drawings complement the text.Dr. Toledo presents his techniques for facial rejuvenation, endoscopic facelift,
rhytidectomy, total body liposculpture, and contouring of the arms, breasts, abdomen, and thighs. Special
attention is given to the use of superficial liposculpture in both facial and body contouring. Other procedures
covered include CO2 laser blepharoplasty, laser resurfacing, and use of the Toledo dissector cannula in body
contouring. Full consideration is also given to defining the aesthetic result desired, as well as to preoperative
and postoperative photography.
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From reader reviews:

Bette Morgan:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Refinements in Facial and
Body Contouring? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time along
with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other
opinion?

Alexander Taylor:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great and also important the book Refinements in Facial and Body
Contouring. All type of book is it possible to see on many methods. You can look for the internet methods or
other social media.

Jeffrey Ramsey:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer may be Refinements in Facial and Body Contouring why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content
will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick
up this book.

Rochelle Barrick:

Beside this Refinements in Facial and Body Contouring in your phone, it may give you a way to get closer to
the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh in the oven
so don't always be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have
Refinements in Facial and Body Contouring because this book offers to you personally readable information.
Do you often have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to
happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this book in addition to read it
from today!
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