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Like many of us, Mark Hertsgaard has long worried about the declining health of our environment. But in
1991, he decided to act on his concern and investigate the escalating crisis for himself. Traveling on his own
dime, he embarked on an odyssey lasting most of the decade and spanning nineteen countries. Now, in
Earth Odyssey, he reports on our environmental predicament through the eyes of the people who live it.

From the gilded boardrooms of Paris to the traffic-clogged streets of Bangkok, we travel from the deep
human past to our still unfolding future. Much of the story revolves around people like Zhenbing,
Hertsgaard's charismatic interpreter in China, whose desire to escape poverty leaves him indifferent to his
country's horrific air and water pollution. We also meet Garang, a proud Dinka tribesman whose response to
Sudan's famine shows the difficulty of building an environmentally sustainable future without bridging the
gap between rich and poor. Drawing on interviews with Václav Havel, Al Gore, Jacques Cousteau, and
numerous other prominent figures, Hertsgaard offers fresh insight into such complex issues as humanity's
growing addiction to the automobile, the insidious spread of nuclear technology, and the inevitable tension
between unfettered capitalism and the health of the biosphere.

Earth Odyssey is a vivid, passionate narrative about one man's journey around the world in search of the
answer to the most important question of our time: Is the future of the human species at risk? Combining
first-rate reportage with irresistible storytelling, Mark Hertsgaard has written an essential--and ultimately
hopeful--book about the uncertain fate of humankind.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Pabon:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice simply by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for
a while is reading. That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to
endure than other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this kind of
Earth Odyssey: Around the World in Search of Our Environmental Future book as beginner and daily
reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Beverly Thomas:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Earth Odyssey: Around the
World in Search of Our Environmental Future is simple to bring you can read it in the park, in the beach,
train and soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the e-
book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Willie Batres:

Beside this particular Earth Odyssey: Around the World in Search of Our Environmental Future in your
phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information
and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people
live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Earth Odyssey: Around the World in Search of Our
Environmental Future because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you at times
have book but you seldom get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if
you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful
island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book along with read it from at this point!

Bonnie Howe:

This Earth Odyssey: Around the World in Search of Our Environmental Future is brand-new way for you
who has curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper
you on it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading
this Earth Odyssey: Around the World in Search of Our Environmental Future can be the light food for you
personally because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books
build itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book contact form. People who
think that in guide form make them feel tired even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in
reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So ,
don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your better life as well as knowledge.
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