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Jessica LeCroix drops a bomb on her best friend, Ramie: “I’m a lesbian.” Ramie Grant cannot believe her
ears. Jess!? Her best friend, her teammate . . . a homosexual? Before long other girls on the basketball team
find out, and little jokes become vicious attacks. In the end, Ramie must decide if she will stand by Jessica’s
side or turn her back on a friend in need. The tenth book in the teen fiction series TrueColors, Bright Purple
examines the subjects of sexuality, identity, and forgiveness. Includes discussion questions.
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From reader reviews:

Jesica Demarco:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book Bright Purple: Color Me Confused (Truecolors
Book 10) had been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The guide Bright Purple: Color Me Confused
(Truecolors Book 10) is not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when
you sense bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using
book Bright Purple: Color Me Confused (Truecolors Book 10). You never really feel lose out for everything
if you read some books.

Michael Mazzariello:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Bright Purple: Color Me Confused (Truecolors
Book 10), it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified
as reading friends.

Judith Cole:

Many people spending their time by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Bright Purple: Color Me Confused
(Truecolors Book 10) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.

Donald Edmond:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Bright Purple:
Color Me Confused (Truecolors Book 10).
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