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With rapidly declining costs and seemingly unlimited sunshine, the choice of solar in Australia seems
obvious. Yet despite its many advantages, homes with solar remain completely dependent on the electricity
grid for reliable supply, which in Australia implies mostly coal-fired generation. Indeed, even countries that
have invested heavily in solar, such as Spain and Germany, have been unable to deflect the trajectory of
fossil fuel dependence.

The reasons for this apparent paradox are varied, and this book provides a deeper and more nuanced
understanding of the practical applications of photovoltaics (PV) in modern electricity systems. While the
conventional life-cycle assessment (LCA) boundaries as prescribed by the IEA-PVPS provide a consistent
methodology for comparing evolving PV technologies, the narrow boundaries exclude many critical
downstream energy costs. Similarly, simple cost comparisons of PV versus conventional power sources
overlook the significant economic and energy costs of intermittency and grid integration. Yet distributed
storage, which could provide potentially valuable network support, is frequently given a low priority by
advocates of solar.

Treating PV as an extension of, rather than as a substitute for, the fossil fuel enterprise enables a more
productive discussion of PV’s potential role in electricity generation. The sunburnt country of Australia,
which has a modern electricity system, is an ideal case study for exploring the potential of solar PV. With a
focus on rooftop solar, energy storage, grid integration, and electricity system issues, Energy in Australia
offers valuable insights into the practical challenges of solar power. Although many national economies are
already confronting a downward trend in energy return on investment (EROI) of oil and gas from both
conventional and unconventional sources, the large-scale deployment of low-emission energy sources that lie
below a critical minimum EROI threshold may ultimately prove counter-productive.
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From reader reviews:

John Loya:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's
Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs in Energy). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. So
long as we know about how is important a book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's
Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs in Energy). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the
world by a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can realize everything! From your country until
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In
this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use
it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's study.

Jeremy Gable:

The book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs in
Energy) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and
Asia's Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs in Energy)? Some of you have a different opinion about book. But
one aim which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using
your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you are able to share
all of these. Book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs
in Energy) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem
the enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Gretchen Clark:

Why? Because this Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's Economic Growth
(SpringerBriefs in Energy) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but
latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who else
write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach
but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer
or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book get such
as help improving your ability and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that
book? If I have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Adrienne Helms:

Guide is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. With
the book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's Economic Growth (SpringerBriefs in



Energy) we can get more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To be creative person must want to
read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to
change your life at this time book Energy in Australia: Peak Oil, Solar Power, and Asia's Economic Growth
(SpringerBriefs in Energy). You can more inviting than now.
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