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Defining more than 10,000 words and phrases from everyday slang to technical terms and concepts, this
dictionary of the audiovisual language embraces more than 50 subject areas within film, television, and home
entertainment. It includes terms from the complete lifecycle of an audiovisual work from initial concept
through commercial presentation in all the major distribution channels including theatrical exhibition,
television broadcast, home entertainment, and mobile media. The dictionary definitions are augmented by
more than 700 illustrations, 1,600 etymologies, and nearly 2,000 encyclopedic entries that provide
illuminating anecdotes, historical perspective, and clarifying details.
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From reader reviews:

Francisco London:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give you lot of
advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book in which
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if
you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy read one using theme
for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual A/V a to Z: An Encyclopedic Dictionary of Media,
Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol set) is kind of guide which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Phillip Vargas:

This A/V a to Z: An Encyclopedic Dictionary of Media, Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol
set) are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this A/V a to Z: An
Encyclopedic Dictionary of Media, Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol set) can be among the
great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but feed an
individual with information that perhaps will shock your before knowledge. This book will be handy, you
can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that
this A/V a to Z: An Encyclopedic Dictionary of Media, Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol
set) forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical
thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Lorraine Bryant:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love A/V a to Z: An Encyclopedic
Dictionary of Media, Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol set), you could enjoy both. It is
very good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind
hangout fellas. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Dwight Hancock:

You could spend your free time to see this book this guide. This A/V a to Z: An Encyclopedic Dictionary of
Media, Entertainment and Other Audiovisual Terms (2 vol set) is simple to develop you can read it in the
park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your
smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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