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Within the pages of this manual, students become personally involved in research as they learn important
analytical, critical thinking, and communication skills, and develop the ability to interpret the contemporary
global situation and its impact on their lives. Linking fundamental concepts of sociology with everyday
activities, the exercises in each chapter lead students through an array of qualitative and quantitative methods
as they test and apply theories. Students experience research as a process of asking questions, defining terms
clearly, seeking patterns, and reaching conclusions based on their findings, while avoiding bias.

Short essays describing current perspectives on globalization accompany the exercises, addressing political,
cultural, social, economic, technological, and religious dimensions.

Key Features

25 research exercises may be completed by students in class or independently, providing flexibility for the●

instructor.
Exercises are ready to be assigned as they appear in the text, with convenient tear-out pages.●

Students investigate intriguing topics such as "Global Ethics," "Violating Folkways," "Bowling Alone,"●

and "McDonald's Versus Jihad."
A variety of research methods are featured: interviews, experiments, functional analysis, content analysis,●

and more.
Extensive follow-up "Discussion" sections help students maximize their understanding.●

Surveys and qualitative exercises adapted from larger studies allow students to compare their results with●

national and global patterns of results, which they may explore further through the Web links provided.

Intended Audience: This interactive manual follows the format of standard introductory sociology texts,
making it an engaging and easy fit for Introductory Sociology or Principles of Sociology courses.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Keller:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age. You
can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a book
Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age. You can add know-how and of course you can around
the world by the book. Absolutely right, since from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing it is possible to know
that. In this era, we can open a book or searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it
when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Christa Nisbet:

The book Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book Sociological Research
Exercises for the Global Age? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim this book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or
info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Sociological
Research Exercises for the Global Age has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Margaret Phillips:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
it is known to us that book is very important normally. The book Sociological Research Exercises for the
Global Age ended up being making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The book Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age is
not only giving you far more new information but also to become your friend when you experience bored.
You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship while using
book Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age. You never truly feel lose out for everything in the
event you read some books.

James Ojeda:

This Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age are usually reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The reason of this Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age can be one of
several great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you
actually with information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book will be handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this
Sociological Research Exercises for the Global Age forcing you to have an enormous of experience
including rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime.



So , let's have it and enjoy reading.
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