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The bestselling author and psychologist whose books have topped 240,000 copies in print now addresses the
trait of “high sensitivity” in children–and offers a breakthrough parenting guidebook for highly sensitive
children and their caregivers.

With the publication of The Highly Sensitive Person, Elaine Aron became the first person to identify the
inborn trait of “high sensitivity” and to show how it affects the lives of those who possess it. Up to 20
percent of the population is born highly sensitive, and now in The Highly Sensitive Child, Aron shifts her
focus to highly sensitive children, who share the same characteristics as highly sensitive adults and thus face
unique challenges as they grow up.

Rooted in Aron’s years of experience as a psychotherapist and her original research on child temperament,
The Highly Sensitive Child shows how HSCs are born deeply reflective, sensitive to the subtle, and easily
overwhelmed. These qualities can make for smart, conscientious, creative children, but with the wrong
parenting or schooling, they can become unusually shy or timid, or begin acting out. Few parents and
teachers understand where this behavior comes from–and as a result, HSCs are often mislabeled as overly
inhibited, fearful, or “fussy,”or classified as “problem children” (and in some cases, misdiagnosed with
disorders such as Attention Deficit Disorder). But raised with proper understanding and care, HSCs are no
more prone to these problems than nonsensitive children and can grow up to be happy, healthy, well-adjusted
adults.

In this pioneering work, parents will find helpful self-tests and case studies to help them understand their
HSC, along with thorough advice on:
• The challenges of raising an highly sensitive child

• The four keys to successfully parenting an HSC

• How to soothe highly sensitive infants

• Helping sensitive children survive in a not-so-sensitive world

• Making school and friendships enjoyable

With chapters addressing the needs of specific age groups, from newborns through teens, The Highly
Sensitive Child delivers warmhearted, timely information for parents, teachers, and the sensitive children in
their lives.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Arlene Oliver:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve The Highly Sensitive Child:
Helping Our Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them will make you to be smarter. You can feel
a lot more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that will open or reading
some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you
searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Maureen Guzman:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
you may know that book is very important for all of us. The book The Highly Sensitive Child: Helping Our
Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them seemed to be making you to know about other
information and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The book The
Highly Sensitive Child: Helping Our Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them is not only giving
you far more new information but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your current
spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while using book The Highly Sensitive Child:
Helping Our Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them. You never really feel lose out for
everything in the event you read some books.

Jennifer Lorenzo:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this The Highly
Sensitive Child: Helping Our Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them, you are able to tells your
family, friends and also soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them
reading a e-book.

Randy Mosley:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Highly Sensitive Child:



Helping Our Children Thrive When the World Overwhelms Them which is having the e-book version. So ,
try out this book? Let's notice.
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