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Tucked in a bend of the Trinity River a few minutes from downtown Fort Worth, the Garden of Eden
neighborhood has endured for well over a century as a homeplace for freed African American slaves and
their descendants.

Among the earliest inhabitants in the Garden, Major and Malinda Cheney assembled over 200 acres of
productive farmland on which they raised crops and cattle, built a substantial home for their children, and
weathered a series of family crises that ranged from a false accusation of rape and attempted lynching to the
murder of their eldest son.

Major and Malinda Cheney’s great-great-grandson, Drew Sanders, recounts engaging tales of the family’s
life against the backdrop of Fort Worth and Tarrant County history—among them stories about the famous
family Sunday dinners (recipes included).

Though some family members, including writer Bob Ray Sanders and transplant specialist Dollie Gentry, no
longer live in this special place, life in the Garden of Eden still shapes the family’s character and binds them
to the homeplace.
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From reader reviews:

Coleman Bailey:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, the actual best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book The Garden of Eden: The Story of
a Freedmen's Community in Texas. All type of book are you able to see on many options. You can look for
the internet resources or other social media.

Robert Spann:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy individual? If you don't
have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question because just their can do which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific The Garden of Eden:
The Story of a Freedmen's Community in Texas to read.

Damian Woodward:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
if those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which
one is suitable to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource
then you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take The Garden of Eden: The Story of a Freedmen's Community in Texas
as the daily resource information.

Armida Shipman:

The reserve untitled The Garden of Eden: The Story of a Freedmen's Community in Texas is the reserve that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person.
The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
article writer was did a lot of research when write the book, and so the information that they share to you is
absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of The Garden of Eden: The Story of a Freedmen's
Community in Texas from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.
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